Saturday, July 25, 2020 at 6:36:40 PM Singapore Standard Time

Subject: FW: Invoice #3 from Quality Paving & Driveways Ltd

Date: Friday, 12 July 2019 at 5:21:18 AM Singapore Standard Time
From: Matthias Hillner

To: matthias hillner

On 12/7/19, 12:52 AM, "miles connors" <mileslgps@icloud.com> wrote:

Hi Mathias it is my professional opinion that the repair works we carried out on your patio we’re only
necessary because of the damaged caused by the liquid coming from the leaking pipe which was definitely not
water and it was that liquid that caused the bricks to stain therefore the works we carried out were necessary to
get the patio back to its original state thanks.

Miles

Sent from. miles
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